HIGHEST BIDDERS FOR QUOTATION 4 OF 2015

DESCRIPTION

ONE LOT OF 50 CONTAINERS CONTAINING PARTS OF PREFABRICATED BUILDINGS CONSISTING OF
GYPSUM BOARDS,FALSE CEILINGS, STEEL STRUCTURES, FLUSH DOORS, UPVC WINDOW FRAMES,
INSULATING MATERIALS, WATERPROOFING MATERIALS, SEALANTS, ETC...

HIGHEST BID RECEIVED

1|TO CONTACT AUCTION SALES TEAM FOR MORE INFORMATION 5,560,000
2|ONE LOT OF 6 ROLLS OF METAL SHEETS 400,000
3|ONE LOT OF ASSORTED SAWN TIMBER 426,777
4|ONE LOT OF PART METAL RACKING SYSTEM 82,550
5[ONE UNIT OF USED ELEVATOR JLG LIFT .MODEL 600AG YEAR 2000 199,112
6[ONE LOT OF INSULTATING MATERIAL FOR AIR CONDITIONING 85,900
7[ONE UNIT OF USED THREE PHASE TRANSFORMER - NOT TESTED UNDER PRICE
8[ONE UNIT OF AIR COOLER MAKE :GEA - NOT TESTED 44,129
9|ONE UNIT OF USED ELEVATOR :MODEL JLG 4069 - NOT TESTED 62,999
10[ONE UNIT OF USED ELEVATOR :MODEL JLG 4069 - NOT TESTED 62,999
11[ONE UNIT OF USED ELEVATOR :MODEL JLG 1932 EZ - NOT TESTED 38,123
12[ONE UNIT OF USED ELEVATOR :MODEL JLG 1932 EZ - NOT TESTED 38,123
13|ONE USED QUAD BIKE YAMAHA BLASTER 6 SPEED 200CC - NOT TESTED 45,111
14[ONE USED QUAD BIKE YAMAHA BLASTER 6 SPEED 200CC - NOT TESTED 46,111
15[ONE USED SMALL BOAT - NOT TESTED 31,000
16[ONE LOT OF 1,450 CARTONS OF 20 BARS OF SOAP 600,000

17|ONE LOT OF 1200 UNITS OF METAL BASKETS (BICYCLE PARTS) NO BID RECEIVED
ONE USED CAR MAKE TOYOTA VITZ CH NO.: KSP1302013177 YR 2011 COLOUR: GREEN METALLIC

18[990CC - NOT TESTED 332,000
ONE USED CAR MAKE TOYOTA VITZ CH NO.: KSP1302029533 YR 2011 COLOUR: SILVER 990CC - NOT

19|TESTED 289,119
ONE USED CAR MAKE TOYOTA VITZ CH NO.: NSP1302034140 YR 2011 COLOUR: WHITE 1329CC - NOT

20|TESTED 304,000
ONE USED CAR MAKE TOYOTA AXIO CH NO.: NZE1413014170 YR 2011 COLOUR: BLUE 1490CC - NOT

21|TESTED REMOVED FROM SALE
ONE USED CAR MAKE NISSAN MARCH CH NO.: K13716568 YR 2013 COLOUR: SILVER 1198CC - NOT

22|TESTED REMOVED FROM SALE
ONE USED CAR MAKE NISSAN MARCH CH NO: AK12839167 YR 2005 COLOUR: SILVER 1240CC - NOT UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT

23|TESTED AWARDED
ONE USED CAR MAKE HONDA JAZZ CH NO.: JHMGD1850045229368 YR 2004 COLOUR: BLUE 1339CC - UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT

24|NOT TESTED AWARDED

25|ONE USED CAR MAKE HONDA FIT CH NO.:GE7151009 YR 2010 COLOUR: BLUE 1330CC - NOT TESTED 283,119
ONE USED CAR MAKE BMW325CI. CH NO. :32010JW35762 YEAR 2003 COLOUR: BLACK 2494CC - NOT UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT

26|TESTED AWARDED

27

ONE USED CAR MAKE ALFA ROMEO CH. NO. : ZAR9370000331 YR 2005 COLOUR: GREY 1910CC - NOT
TESTED

NO BID RECEIVED

28

ONE USED CAR MAKE PEUGEOT 207 CH NO.: VF3WC5FS9AW084329 YR 2006 COLOUR:BLUE 1590CC -
NOT TESTED

NO BID RECEIVED

29

ONE USED LEFT HAND DRIVE OPEL CAR CH: WOLOTGF7512118639
TO BE SOLD AS SCRAP

UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT
AWARDED

ONE USED UNIT SECOND HAND CAR NISSAN X-TRAIL CHASSIS NO JN1TBNT30Z0025752 ENGINE

30|CAPACITY: 2488CC YEAR: 2005 - NOT TESTED NO BID RECEIVED
ONE UNIT SECOND HAND CAR MAKE CHERY A15.CHASSIS NO LVVDA11A27D006158 ENGINE CAPACITY: UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT

31|1596CC YEAR: 2007 - NOT TESTED AWARDED
ONE UNIT SECOND HAND CAR HONDA CRV.CHASSIS NO JHLRD58405C200847 ENGINE CAPACITY:

32]|1998CC YEAR: 2005 - NOT TESTED NO BID RECEIVED
ONE UNIT SECOND HAND CAR FIAT PANDA.CHASSIS NO ZFA16900000713248 ENGINE CAPACITY: UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT

33]|1242CC YEAR: 2007 - NOT TESTED AWARDED
ONE USED VAN MAKE MITSHUBISHI, MODEL DELICIA CH NO: PESW-0305662 COLOUR BLACK YEAR

3411997. NO KEYS AVAILABLE. NOT TESTED. 62,300
ONE USED CAR MAKE CHRYSLER MODEL 300C YEAR 2006 CH NO:1C3H9E3G56Y147282 COLOUR

35|BLACK. NO KEYS AVAILABLE. NOT TESTED 284,777
ONE USED CAR MAKE BMW MODEL 7501 YEAR 2000 CH NO: WBAGJ02050DD63458 COLOUR GREEN.

36|NO KEYS AVAILABLE. NOT TESTED. 62,197
ONE USED CAR MAKE BMW MODEL 318i CH NO. WBAPF52080A497071 GREY COLOUR YEAR 2010. NOT

37|TESTED. 375,000




ONE USED CAR MAKE RENAULT, MODEL SCENIC CH NO:VF1JA04B523289907 YEAR 2001 COLOUR

38|SILVER GREY. NO KEYS AVAILBLE. NOT TESTED 40,000
ONE USED MITSHIBISHI SPACE WAGON CH/NO JMALNN84WZ000142 YEAR 2000. NO KEYS AVAILABLE.
39|NOT TESTED 117,900
ONE USED CAR MAKE TOYOTA MODEL LEXUS IS 220d CH.NO. JTH13262702015993 SILVER COLOUR
40|ENGINE CAPACITY: 2200CC YEAR 2006. NOT TESTED. 126,000
ONE USED CAR MAKE VAUXHALL, MODEL ZAFIRA YEAR 2001 CH/NO: WOLOTG751H008800 COLOUR
41|GREEN. NO KEYS AVAILABLE. NOT TESTED 65,399
42[ONE USED CAR MAKE CITROEN, MODEL XSARA, CH/NO:VF7NKFWB73261232, COLOUR GREY 50,000
ONE USED CAR MAKE AUDI MODEL A4 YEAR 1997 CH NO. WAUZZZ8DZVA287917 COLOUR SILVER
43|GREY. NO KEYS AVAILABLE. NOT TESTED 36,555
44|ONE LOT OF ASSORTED METAL STRUCTURE PARTLY RUSTED 11,111
45|ONE USED DOOR FOR REFRIGERATED ROOM 3,542
46(4 PCS IRON STANDS 4,576
47|ONE LOT OF 180 PCS CHILDREN AND LADIES ENSEMBLE 10,800
48|ONE LOT OF 277 CHILDREN DRESSES 34,625
49|ONE LOT OF 32 PCS LARGE TABLE CLOTH 6,000
50|ONE LOT OF 380 PCS SMALL TABLE CLOTH 9,763
51|ONE LOT OF 40 CHILDREN SKIRTS 3,000
52|ONE LOT OF 45 LADIES SKIRT 4,000
53|ONE LOT OF 15 CHILDREN TOP 1,000
54|ONE LOT OF 69 LADIES TOP 4,500
55|ONE LOT OF 14 PCS PADDED PANTS & 5 SILICON BRA & ACCESSORIES. 2,700
56|ONE LOT OF 6 PCS EARINGS & 54 PCS SWIMMING SUIT & 4 LADIES SKIRTS & 4 LADIES TOPS 3,861
5714000 PLASTIC CLIPS FOR GARMENT AND 400 CLIP FOR BRA AND 800 METAL CLIP FOR GARMENTS 2,000
58|ONE LOT OF ASSORTED DOG & CAT CHAINS 2,509
59|ONE ACOUSTIC GUITAR VALENCIA 1,591
60(1 LOT OF THIRTY (30)TABLET POUCH 1,759
61|ONE USED SAMSUNG TABLET GTP3110 5,242
62|ONE USED IPAD A1458 W/O ACC 5,618
63|ONE USED NOKIA 1202/2 201
64|ONE USED NOKIA RM-414 397
65|ONE USED ALCATEL 292 550
66|ONE USED BLACKBERRY 9360 900
67|ONE USED NOKIA C1-00 200
68|ONE USED NOKIA 1800 200
69|ONE USED NOKIA 6303CI 500
70|ONE USED NOKIA C2-01 500
71|ONE USED NOKIA 7100S-2 505
72|ONE USED MOBILE PH1 NOKIA 16 16-2 150
73|ONE USED MOBILE PH1 GREY COLOR NOKIA 100 200
74|ONE USED MOBILE PH1 MAKE LG GS107 275
75|ONE USED MOBILE PHONE SAMSUNG GTE1080 275
76|ONE USED MOBILE PHONE NOKIA 405
77|ONE USED MOBILE PHONE LG 1,300
78|ONE USED MOBILE PHONE BLACKBERRY 800
79|ONE USED MOBILE PHONE LG 599
80|ONE USED CAMERA MAKE NIKON 1,706
81|ONE USED PINK CAMERA NIKKON 1,799
82|ONE USED CAMERA SONY CYBERSHOT 1,305
83|ONE USED DIGITAL CAMERA OLYMPUS W/O ACCS 616
84|ONE TRANSFORMER 415
85|ONE MV INTERIOR LAMP COVER 100
86|ONE LOT OF 6 PCS M/V SPARE PARTS-CLUTCH COVER 1,618
87|ONE LOT OF 28 LEGGING 800
88|ONE MOTOR BLOC 2M 2008 W1655A POOL 800
89|ONE LOT OF 3 PCS MACHINERY SPARE PARTS 300
90|ONE UNIT DASH BOARD PART 200
91|ELECTRONIC PART 100
92|ONE LOT 4 PCS INFLATABLE SOLAR SYSTEM 842
1 LOT OF 4 X CISCO N 50-10-P-N2KBE AND 1 X CISCO WS-SUP 720-
93|3BXL AND 1 X F10 RSP720-3CXL-GE 1,000
94|ONE ELECTRIC BAKING OVEN 5,500
95|ONE ELECTRIC PLATE 2,000
96|1 LOT OF 2 X 75 CL CHIVAS REGAL WHISKY 3,189
97|1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL CHIVAS REGAL WHISKY 9,699




98|1 LOTOF1X37.5CL, 1 X70CL, 1 X100 CL JACK DANIELS WHISKY 4,158
99|1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL JACK DANIELS WHISKY 6,844
100|1 X 100 CL JOHNNIE WALKER GOLD LABEL WHISKY 2,713
101{1 LOT OF 2 X 20 CL, 3 X 100 CL JOHNNIE WALKER EXPLORERS CLUB WHISKY 9,011
102|1 LOT OF 2 X 100 CL GOLDEN ROUTE & 1 X 100 CL ROYAL ROUTE JOHNNIE WALKER WHISKY 9,500
103[1 LOT OF 3 X 70 CL JOHNNIE WALKER RED LABEL WHISKY 3,000
104)1 LOT OF 3 X 100 CL JOHNNIE WALKER RED LABEL WHISKY 5,299
105{1 LOTOF 1 X 100CL, 1 X 1.125 CL & 1 X 200 CL JOHNNIE WALKER RED LABEL WHISKY 6,381
106|1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL JOHNNIE WALKER BLACK LABEL WHISKY 8,665
107|1 LOT OF 3 X 100 CL JOHNNIE WALKER DOULBE BLACK WHISKY 8,500
108]1 X 100 CL JOHNNIE WALKER GREEN LABEL WHISKY 2,313
109{1 LOTOF 1 X 125CL, 1 X 70 CL & 2 X 50 CL BALLENTINES WHISKY 3,601
110|1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL BALLENTINES WHISKY 7,000
111{1 LOT OF 4 X 100 CL GLENMORANGIE WHISKY 6,500
1121 LOT OF 4 X 100 CL & 1 X 70 CL GLENFIDDICH WHISKY 12,199
113[1 X 100 CL GLENLIVET WHISKY 1,950
1141 LOT OF 6 X 100 CL JAMESON IRISH WHISKY 8,500
115{1 LOTOF 1 X 70 CL & 1 X 75 CL GRANTS WHISKY 4,908
116|1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL GRANTS WHISKY 6,200
117|1 LOT OF 2 X 100 CL TEACHERS WHISKY 2,533
118{1 LOTOF1X50CL, 1 X 70 CL &5 X 100 CL J AND B WHISKY 8,500
119(1 LOT OF 4 X 100 CL FAMOUS GROUSE & 1 X 100 CL BLACK GROUSE WHISKY 7,000
120|1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL VAT 69 WHISKY 6,000
121)1 LOT OF 3 X 100 CL DEWARS WHISKY 4,302
1221 LOT OF 1 X 50 CL & 4 X 70 CL ASSORTED WHISKY 3,633
123[1 LOT OF 2 X 75 CL & 2 X 100 CL ASSORTED WHISKY 4,000
124]1 LOT OF 4 X 100 CL ASSORTED WHISKY 4,033
125{1 LOTOF 1 X 70 CL & 5 X 100 CL KING ROBERT WHISKY 5,113
126|1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL BOMBAY SAPPHIRE GIN 3,711
127]|1 LOT OF 6 X 100 CL GORDON'S LONDON DRY GIN 3,800
128[1 LOTOF 1 X 75 CL & 1 X 100 CL HENDRICK GIN + 2 X 100 CL GREY GOOSE GIN 3,665
129(1 LOTOF 1 X 70 CL & 1 X 75 CL SMIRNOFF VODKA 750
130|1 LOT OF 4 X 100 CL SMIRNOFF VODKA 2,133
1311 LOTOF5X5CL, 1 X37.5CL & 1 X 100 CL ABSOLUT VODKA + 2 X 5 CL CHAMAREL GOLD 1,895
132]|1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL ABSOLUT VODKA ASSORTED FLAVOUR 3,600
133[1 LOT OF 3 X 70 CL & 3 X 75 CL ASSORTED VODKA 2,100
134]1 LOT OF 4 X 100 CL ASSORTED VODKA 2,517
1351 LOT OF 3 X 100 CL & 1 X 1.125 CL CAPTAIN MORGAN RUM 2,300
136|1 LOT OF 3 X 70 CL PINK PIGEON 1,157
137]1 LOT OF 5 X 50 CL ST AUBIN RHUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 1,157
138|1 LOT OF 3 X 70 CL ST AUBIN SPICED RHUM 957
139]1 LOT OF 4 X 75 CL ST AUBIN RHUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 1,400
140|1 LOT OF 4 X 33 CL NEW GROVE RHUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 700
141)1 LOT OF 5X 70 CL NEW GROVE RHUM ASSORTED FLAVOUR 1,390
142(1 LOT OF 4 X 70 CL RHUM L'AVENTURE ASSORTED FLAVOUR 1,066
143]1 LOT OF 6 X 50 CL RHUM CHAMAREL ASSORTED FLAVOUR 2,055
144]11 LOT OF 5 X 70 CL RHUM CHAMAREL ASSORTED FLAVOUR 1,430
145]1 LOT OF 11 X 50 CL RHUM BOUGAINVILLE ASSORTED FLAVOUR 2,333
146|1 LOT OF 2 X 25 CL & 6 X 35 CL ASSORTED RHUM 940
UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT
147]1 LOT OF 7 X 70 CL GOODWILL RHUM AWARDED
1481 LOT OF 13 X 70 CL GREEN ISLAND ASSORTED FLAVOUR NO BID RECEIVED
149|1 LOT OF 3 X 100 CL GREEN ISLAND 1,582
150{1 LOTOF3X70CL,2 X 100 CL & 1 X 150 CL SEVEN SEAS NO BID RECEIVED
151|1 LOT OF 15 X5 CL & 4 X 72 CL LABOURDONNAIS RHUM 1,620
1521 LOT OF 7 X 70 CL ASSORTED TAKAMAKA RUM 1,899
153|1 LOT OF 2 X 100 CL & 2 X 70 CL RHUM CHARETTE 1,633
1541 LOT OF 17 X 70 CL ISLAND RECIPE RHUM 4,905
155]1 LOT OF 3 X 100 CL BACARDI RUM 1,233
156|1 LOT OF 6 X 70 CL ASSORTED DZAMA RUM 2,129
157[1 LOT OF 4 X 70 CL ASSORTED ISAUTIER PUNCH NO BID RECEIVED
158|1 LOT OF 5 X 25 CL RUM AUX FRUITS ASSORTED FLAVOUR NO BID RECEIVED
159(1 LOT OF 9 X 37.5 CL & 3 X 50 CL ASSORTED RUM 1,833
160{1 LOT OF 1 X 50 CL & 7 X 70 CL ASSORTED RUM 2,133
161{1 LOTOF4 X 75CL,2X 100 CL & 1 X 1.125 CL ASSORTED RUM 2,507

162

1 LOT OF 3 X 37.5CL & 3 X 70 CL DE LUXE RUM

NO BID RECEIVED




UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT

163[1 LOT OF 3 X 70 CL DUKES CANE LIQUOR AWARDED
UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT
1641 LOTOF4 X 70 CL & 1 X 100 CL CHATEL PUNCH AWARDED
1651 LOT OF 1 X 75 CL & 4 X 100 CL ASSORTED LIQUOR 1,510
166(1 LOT OF 4 X 50 CL DIVINE LETCHI 531
167]|1 LOT OF 6 X 50 CL ASSORTED ALCOHOLIC PRODUCTS 2,149
168[1 LOTOF1X70CL, 2 X 75 CL & 4 X 100 CL ASSORTED ALCOHOLIC PRODUCTS 5,611
169]1 LOT OF 7 X 100 CL ASSORTED ALCOHOLIC PRODUCTS 8,557
170{1 LOT OF 8 X 100 CL ASSORTED ALCOHOLIC PRODUCTS 4,227
171)1 LOT OF 4 X 100 CL BAILEYS LIQUEUR 1,900
172{1LOTOF 1 X50 CL & 1 X 75 CL AMARULA LIQUEUR 713
173]1 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL AMARULA LIQUEUR 2,300
17411 LOT OF 5 X 100 CL WILD AFRICA LIQUEUR 2,480
175|1 LOT OF 3 X 70 CL COCO D'AMOUR LIQUEUR 1,933
176]|1 LOT OF 3 X 100 CL COCO SHERIDANS LIQUEUR 1,619
177)1 LOT OF 11 X 100 CL ASSORTED MARTINI 5,500
178[1 LOT OF 1 X 50 CL & 3 X 100 CL PASTIS LIQUEUR 1,933
179]1 LOT OF 4 X 100 CL PASTIS LIQUEUR 1,557
180|1 LOT OF 7 X 75 CL DE CRAMON SPARKLING WINE 1,600
181)1 LOT OF 9 X 75 CL SPARKLING WINE 1,857
UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT
182]1 LOT OF 8 X 75 CL SPARKLING WINE AWARDED
183|1 LOT OF 29 X 18.7 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,708
1841 LOTOF5X20CL, 3X 37.5CL & 2 X 50 CL ASSORTED ALCOHOLIC PRODUCTS 1,648
1851 LOT OF 3 X 70 CL & 4 X 75 CL ASSORTED LOCAL WINE 1,400
186[1 LOTOF5X 70 CL & 1 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 1,957
187]1 LOT OF 6 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,128
188|1 LOT OF 7 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,300
189|1 LOT OF 33 X 18.7 CL ASSORTED WINE 3,511
1901 LOTOF 1 X 75 CL & 4 X 150 CL LA MOTTE WINE 3,711
1911 LOT OF 1 X 25 CL & 5 X 75 CL ASSORTED NEDERBERG WINE 1,900
1921 LOT OF 5 X 75 CL CAPINELLA SPARKLING WINE 1,210
193]|1 LOT OF 3 X 75 CL NON ALCOHOLIC SPARKLING WINE 765
1941 LOT OF 3 X 75 CL HANNELI R. WINE 1,217
195]1 LOT OF 6 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,611
196|1 LOT OF 8 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,600
1971 LOT OF 1 X 70 CL & 4 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,000
198|1 LOT OF 6 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 1,800
199]1 LOT OF 6 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,535
200|1 LOT OF 6 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,005
201|1 LOT OF 6 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,079
202|1 LOT OF 6 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,069
203|1 LOT OF 6 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 2,369
204|1 LOT OF 8 X 75 CL ASSORTED WINE 3,398
205|ONE UNIT OF ELECTRIC STACKER MODEL 5PN15730 15,000
206|RING 3.37 G 18K GOLD 3,000
207|RING 3.27G 18K GOLD 2,900
208|RING 2.09 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.38 CT 12,500
209|RING 1.91G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.20 CT 5,051
210|GOLD RING 2.49 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 5,700
211|RING 2.04 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.25 CT REMOVED FROM SALE
212|RING 18K WHITE GOLD 1. 48 G WHITE PEARL 7.0-7.5MM DIA 8RND/0.04CT 3,510
213|GOLD RING 1.95 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 3,511
214|RING 2.19 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.11 CT YELLOW GOLD 3,501
215|RING 3.23 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.20 CT YELLOW GOLD 5,000
216|GOLD RING 2.69 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.27CT 6,000
217|GOLD RING 3.12 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 6,000
218|RING OF YELLOW METAL WITH 7 WHITE STONES 3.7G 18K GOLD 3,000
219|GOLD RING 1.75 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 5,399
220|RING 2.55 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.19 CT 6,199
221|RING 2.48 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.23 CT 56,200
222|RING 18K GOLD 2.75 G WHITE GOLD TAHITIAN PEARL 8.0-8.5MM 3,810
223|RING 1.65 G WHITE GOLD 18 CARAT RD WHITE DIAMOND 0.10 CT YELLOW GOLD 2,791
224|EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.30 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD 2,710
225|EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.53 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.19 CT YELLOW GOLD 4,510

226

EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.76 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20 CT YELLOW GOLD

4,250




227|EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.62 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD 5,900
228|EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.93G WHITE DIAMOND 0.29CT WHITE GOLD 7,199
229|EARING 18K GOLD 1.05G WHITE DIAMOND 2,500
230|EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.89 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD 6,019
231|EARING 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.88 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.20CT YELLOW GOLD 6,829
232|EARING CLEAR CUBIC ZIRCONIA 250
233|EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES 290
234|EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES 300
235|BRACELET 18K WHITE GOLD DIA 0.25CT 7,952
236|GOLD CHAIN (18K GOLD) 10.96G 10,000
237|PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 1.77 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.15CT 5,100
238|GOLD PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.32 G 4,500
239|PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 3.16 G WHITE DIAMOND 0.10CT 4,100
240|PENDANT-CHAIN 18 CARAT GOLD MASS 2.940G WHITE DIAMOND 4,700
241|PENDANT 18K WHITE GOLD 1.79 G WHITE DIAMOND 11RND/0.24CT 5,800

ONE LOT OF GOLD JEWELLERY:

1 CHAIN: 22.9 G 18K GOLD

1 CHAIN: 2.77 G 14K GOLD

1 PR EARING: 0.9 G 18K GOLD

1 EARING: 9K GOLD

1 BRACELET: 4.91G 18K GOLD
2421 BROKEN RING: 3.55G 18K GOLD 40,000
243|GOLD PLATED GOURMETS (NAME PLATE) 290
244|GOLD PLATED GOURMETS (NO NAME PLATE) 250
245|GOLD PLATED NECKLACES 405
246|GOLD PLATED RINGS 200
247|NECKLACE CULTURED PEARL 7MM LENGTH 180CM 2,611

248|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL NO BID RECEIVED
249|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL NO BID RECEIVED
250|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL / ENAMEL 500
251|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL / ENAMEL 500
252|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL / ENAMEL 500
253|PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL 500
254|PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL 600
255|PENDANT OVAL MULTICOLOR R/P CZ 600
256|PENDANT OVAL MULTICOLOR R/P CZ 700
257|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL / ENAMEL 500
258|BROOCH 500
259|PENDANT R/P ENAMEL CZ 500
260|PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.60 G SILVER 1,060
261|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL 500
262|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL 500
263|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL 2,000
264|PENDANT R/P CRYSTAL/ ENAMEL 700
265|PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL 500
266|PENDANT R/P ENAMEL / CRYSTAL 500
267|PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.51 G SILVER 700
268|PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.61 G SILVER 855
269|PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 9.5-10MM CHAIN 1.58 G SILVER 500
270|PENDANT R/P ENAMEL CZ 500
271|PENDANT ROUND MULTICOLOR R/P CZ 600
272|PENDANT SILVER RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 7.0MM CHAIN 1.61 G SILVER 700
273|PENDANT SILVER 3.72 G WITH RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM 518
274|PENDANT SILVER WITH RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM CHAIN 1.58 G SILVER 700
275|BROOCH R/P RCZ 500
276|BROOCH R/P CRYSTAL 400
277|BROOCH R/P CRYSTAL 400
278|BROOCH R/P CRYSTAL 400
279|PENDANT WITH ENAMEL / CRYSTAL 500
280|PENDANT WITH ENAMEL / CRYSTAL 500
281|NECKLACE 4.87 G SILVER R/P CRYSTAL 1,000
282|NECKLACE COLOUR CZ 800
283|EARING SILVER R/P CULTURED PEARL,CUBIC ZIRCONIA 275
284|NECKLACE 12.66 G SILVER R/P CULTURED PEARL 750
285|NECKLACE SILVER R/P CRYSTAL CHAIN 1.73 G SILVER 800
286|EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES 100




UNDER RESERVE PRICE NOT
287|EARING OF PEARLS,CUBIC ZIRCONIAS AND MAN-MADE GLASSES AWARDED
288|PENDANT R/P CZ 600
289|PENDANT SILVER 4.71 G RHODIUM PLATED CULTURED PEARL 8.0-8.5MM 500
290|PENDANT WITH ENAMEL / CRYSTAL 500
291|NECKLACE SILVER R/P CRYSTAL CHAIN 1.58 G SILVER 800
292 |NECKLACE WITH CRYSTAL CULTURED PEARL 7MM LENGTH 120CM 2,111




